
 
 

 
 
 

 

Terms and Conditions of the “Tasteful Europe” Competition 

 

General provisions 

1. The organiser of the competition is the Polish Nationwide Association of Butchers of the Republic 
of Poland, ul. Miodowa 14, 00-246 Warszawa, Poland. 

2. The competition is organised as part of the promotional campaign “Tasteful Europe – Tradition 
and Quality” financed with the European Union funds. The content of this promotional campaign 
reflects the views of the author only and the author is solely responsible for it. The European 
Commission is not responsible for any use that may be made of the information contained in the 
campaign. 

3. The controller of personal data of Participants is Krajowa Izba Gospodarcza Centrum Promocji Sp. z 
o.o. [Polish Chamber of Commerce Promotion Centre Ltd.]; address: Trębacka 4, 00-074 Warszawa; 
Tax Identification Number (NIP): 5260001708. Personal data will be used for the purpose of carrying 
out the Competition and after the selection of Winners for the purpose of sending prizes. 

4. The competition is not created, administered or sponsored by Facebook. Facebook is a registered 
trademark of Facebook, Inc.  

5. The competition is run on the following website: www.facebook.com/Tastefuleurope.HongKong/, 
hereinafter referred to as the “Fanpage”.  

 

Conditions for participation 

1. Only persons over the age of 18 may participate in the Competition.  

2. Participation in the Competition is conditioned by having a verified Facebook account.  

3. Participation in the Competition is conditioned by the prior completion of an anonymous 
questionnaire. 

4. Participation in the Competition is conditioned by not making available the Competition Question 
to other persons, in particular to other Competition Participants. 

5. The Competition lasts from 13th July 2021 till 26th July 2021, 11:59 p.m. 

6. Results will be announced via Fanpage on 30th July 2021. 

7. The Organiser is not responsible for the temporary or permanent blocking of the website or 
application by Facebook. 

 

Competition task 

1. The Competition Task consists in answering the Competition Question: ‘What do you like most 
about high-quality safe food from the EU? Answer in one sentence!’ upon fulfilling the requirement 
of filling in the anonymous questionnaire. 



 
 

 
 
 

2. In order to participate in the Competition, the Participant must click the link in the competition 
post or in the advertisement shown on Facebook. He will be redirected to the page: 
(https://indata.instytut-pollster.pl/b/7ixgog/index.html?s=ron&lang=en&source=fb) to fill in the 
anonymous questionnaire not influencing the victory in the Competition; after the questionnaire is 
filled in, the Participant must confirm that he has read the rules and then the Competition Question 
will be displayed, the answer to which must be placed in a comment under the Competition Post on 
the Fanpage or in a private message sent via Fanpage. 

3. 3 Winners will be selected in the Competition. 

4. The Jury appointed by the Organiser will select 3 responses to the Competition Question, which 
they find the most creative, and will thus select the Competition winners.            

5. In the case of two or more identical answers to the Competition Question, the answer that was 
posted first wins. 

6. Specific responses to the questions form the questionnaire do not affect the chance to win in the 
Competition. Responses are provided anonymously and have no influence on the selection of the 
Competition Winners. 

7. The Competition Winners will be notified about winning and informed about the terms of 
collecting the Prize via a private message sent on Facebook. 

 

Prize 

1. The prize in the Competition is a set of promotional materials of the Organiser, which includes: 1st 
place – cash voucher for online purchases on the website https://www.amazon.com/ worth HKD 800 
and the cookbook TastefulEurope in the form of an e-book; 2nd and 3rd place – cash voucher for 
online purchases on the website  https://www.amazon.com/  worth HKD 400 and the cookbook 
TastefulEurope in the form of an e-book.  

2. The prize will be sent electronically via a private message on Facebook. 

3. The Organiser has the right to publish the name of the Facebook User who won the competition 
and his/her answer to the Competition Question. 

4. The Organiser is by no means responsible for the inability to transfer the prize for reasons 
attributable to the Participant. In this case, the prize is forfeited. 

5. The Organiser is not responsible for incorrect data provided in the message by the Participant, in 
particular for the change of personal data that makes it impossible to find the Participant who has 
won the prize. 

6. In the event of detecting actions inconsistent with these Terms and Conditions, attempts to 
influence the selection of the Winner in an unlawful manner, in particular by setting up fictitious 
private profiles on Facebook, the Participant may be excluded from the Competition.  

7. The Organiser reserves the right to change the gift voucher for another online shopping platform 
while ensuring a similar value of the voucher. 

 

 

Complaints 

about:blank
about:blank
about:blank


 
 

 
 
 

1. Any complaints regarding the manner of conducting the Competition should be submitted by the 
Participants in writing during the Competition, but not later than within 30 (thirty) days from the 
date of announcing the Winners.  

2. A complaint submitted after the deadline will not be accepted.  

3. A written complaint should include the name, surname, exact address of the Participant, as well as 
a detailed description and justification of the complaint. The complaint should be sent by registered 
mail to the Organiser’s address with the annotation “Competition on Facebook”. 

4. Complaints will be considered in writing within 30 days from the date of receipt. 

 

Final provisions 

1. In any matters not regulated under these Rules, the provisions of the Civil Code and other 

provisions of Polish law will apply. 

2. Disputes related to and resulting from the Competition will be resolved by the common court 
competent for the registered office of the Organiser. 

3. The Organizer reserves the right to change the provisions of the Competition Terms and 
Conditions during its duration. Information about changes will be posted on the Fanpage. 

4. Participation in the Competition is tantamount to reading and accepting the provisions of these 
Terms and Conditions by the Participant, as well as the Participant’s commitment to comply with 
these provisions. 

5. The Rules of the Competition will enter into force as of 13th July 2021. 


